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SEPTEMBER 29 – OCTOBER 1, 2025

BAGGING, POUCHING & WRAPPING

Start planning your PACK EXPO Las Vegas 
booth visits with the help of this walking guide, 
customized by category. Compiled in these 
pages are location and product details for select 
exhibitors to add to your must-see list.
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CODING, LABELING & PRINTING

Start planning your PACK EXPO Las Vegas 
booth visits with the help of this walking guide, 
customized by category. Compiled in these 
pages are location and product details for select 
exhibitors to add to your must-see list.
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CONVEYING, FEEDING & HANDLING

Start planning your PACK EXPO Las Vegas 
booth visits with the help of this walking guide, 
customized by category. Compiled in these 
pages are location and product details for select 
exhibitors to add to your must-see list.
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FILLING, CAPPING & CLOSING

Start planning your PACK EXPO Las Vegas 
booth visits with the help of this walking guide, 
customized by category. Compiled in these 
pages are location and product details for select 
exhibitors to add to your must-see list.
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FOOD PROCESSING

Start planning your PACK EXPO Las Vegas 
booth visits with the help of this walking guide, 
customized by category. Compiled in these 
pages are location and product details for select 
exhibitors to add to your must-see list.
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MULTI-PACKING & END-OF-LINE

Start planning your PACK EXPO Las Vegas 
booth visits with the help of this walking guide, 
customized by category. Compiled in these 
pages are location and product details for select 
exhibitors to add to your must-see list.
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